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6.   The findings of the exercise demonstrated that, particularly in the case of 

brokerage firms, it was not uncommon that high-yield corporate bonds, which 
are generally below investment grade or unrated, were recommended to the 
shoppers.    

 
7.   In particular, deficiencies were noted in the quality of explanation of product 

features and disclosure of risks. For example, some sales representatives did 
not explain that the recommended bonds are high-yield in nature and subject 
to higher risks, such as greater credit risk and higher vulnerability to economic 
cycles, than typical corporate bonds.   

 
8.   It was also noted in some instances that the sales representatives did not 

disclose relevant and material information, such as the credit rating and yield, 
to explain the nature of the investment and the risks involved.  

 
9.   In some instances, sales representatives even provided inaccurate 

information to the shoppers. For example, a sales representative advised that 
investing in bonds is a low risk investment, even though the recommended 
high-yield bond was exposed to higher credit risk. In another instance, the 
sales representative advised that default risk was the only risk associated 
with the recommended bonds.   

 

Selling of derivative products  
 
10.   Licensed corporations are required to conduct proper KYC procedures on 

their clients. Enhanced measures under the Code of Conduct require that 
licensed corporations should, as part of the KYC procedures, assess clients’ 
knowledge of derivatives and characterize them based on their knowledge of 
derivatives3.  

 
11.   It was noted that the sales representatives of over half of the firms included in 

the exercise recommended SFC-authorized funds (Authorized Funds) that 
may use financial derivative instruments for investment purposes or leverage4. 
However, some of the sales representatives did not conduct an assessment 
of the shoppers’ knowledge of derivatives.   

 
12.   In addition, sales representatives generally failed to explain to shoppers the 

use of derivative instruments in recommended products and the risks 
associated with investing in such products.  And only a few of the sales 
representatives provided Product Key Facts Statements (Product KFS)5 to the 
shoppers.  

 

                                                
3
 Paragraph 5.1A of the Code of Conduct. 

4
 The SFC issued a circular in April 2012 to provide intermediaries with guidance in determining whether 

an SFC-authorized fund is a derivative product for the purpose of the Code of Conduct. 
5
 Product KFS are required under the SFC Handbook for Unit Trusts and Mutual Funds, Investment-

Linked Assurance Schemes and Unlisted Structured Investment Products for SFC-authorized products. 





 

 




